


 

Executive summary 

Based in one of the fastest developing shipping hubs in the world, Kangaroo 
Logistics Pvt Ltd specialises in total logistics requirements and services, related to 
your business. As a customer, you know that competing in the Global market, 
takes more than just the right product. This is where we can help you. Kangaroo 
Logistics Pvt Ltd ensures delivery of your products to the Right Place, at the Right 
Time and at the Right Price.....which makes all the difference. 

Activities 

Kangaroo Logistics Pvt Ltd an international freight forwarding company based 
in Mumbai, Pune & Chennai and is organised on a functional basis. Individual 
departments perform core activities which encompass 

• International Project Cargo Handling 

• Warehousing and Distribution. (WMS) 

• International Air / Sea / Land- Freight Management. 

• Consolidation Services/LCL (Groupage) 

• Export & Cross Trades 

• Bonded Logistics Services (Free trade zone) 

• Land Transportation 

• Sea / Air Operations 

• OOG Cargo & Special Equipments 

 



 

International Project Cargo Handling 

Kangaroo Logistics Pvt Ltd expertise and experienced Project team provides an 
excellent and time bound services for voluminous cargo movement with 24x7 
hour support, to all parts of the world. We are specialised in automotive, 
construction, heavy engineering, energy, Oil and gas industry projects. 

Kangaroo Logistics places a significant emphasis on forming trust and long 
term relationships with both our clients and suppliers. 

By having an Experienced team of project staff KLPL specialist in-house skills 
place KLPL in a position to handle any out of gauge or Heavy lift Project Cargo. 

KLPL operations department upon request provides our client with complete 
post-fixture follow up and can handle the entire operations which includes, 

• Pre loading preparations,  

• Cargo clearance, customs arrangements, documentation work 

• Arrangements and Supervision of Stevedoring operations. 

• Instructions to Masters and agents 

• On/Off hire surveys. 

• Liability Insurance. 

• Bunkering arrangements at lowest market prices. 

• Conducting all correspondences and liaising with owners/Shippers on our 
client’s behalf. 

The concept of complete service has proven to be a key to KLPL success. KLPL all 
round service package will enable our clients to charter Ships in confidence with 
assurance that the transport will be capably handled, independently by KLPL. 

 



 

Warehousing and Distribution 

Kangaroo Logistics Pvt Ltd handles General storage Warehousing facility as per 
customers requirements. KLPL is currently handling storage and distribution services 
in CANADA thru its associate. Further, we have customers who are international 
branded companies looking for Exporting & Importing   bulk cargo to INDIA as per 
market requirements. 

Kangaroo Logistics Pvt Ltd also plans to consolidate and manage the Movement 
of Merchandise to distribution centers and retail outlets domestically, regionally and 
around the globe. KLPL provides consolidation services that improves reliability and 
reduces Supply chain costs for our customers. When our customers do not need an 
entire ocean container, LCL(Less than Container Load). Kangaroo Logistics Pvt 
Ltd will combine or consolidate the products in one FCL (Full Container Load) with 
multiple customers cargoes, so that our customer will save more money by paying 
only the freight rates based on the actual shipment dimensions and weight. We will 
utilise the container space and organise the container loading according to the 
different characteristics of the goods and design the direct and transshipment routes 
and solutions to meet the different requirements of the customers. 

Contract Ware Housing: 
We have a complete range of Warehousing and distribution services. Our Facilities 
blend modern systems and equipment with industry-best practices to lower your 
warehousing and distribution costs while increasing your service levels. Our 
unmatched experience in managing dedicated and multi-user facilities supports 
customers. 

Kangaroo Logistics Pvt Ltd is the single-source contact for many customers with 
multiple distribution.We can design solutions tailored to your unique needs with 
facilities, equipment and people dedicated to your business. This allows you to focus 
investments on supporting your core business. Our dedicated warehouse 
management solutions helps you reduce operational costs through efficient 
processes and targeted use of warehouse automation and reduce inventory through 
better supply chain planning. 

We take full responsibility for your inventory, freeing you to spend the time running 
your business. We also enable you to reduce supply chain inventory, eliminate out of 
stock goods and decrease logistics costs. Using shared data, the suppliers are able 
to better plan production schedules, procure raw materials more efficiently and 
achieve greater stability through consistent. demand planning. we help suppliers with 
production forecasting, transportation management and distribution to better fill 
customer orders, while reducing total supply chain inventory with forecast visibility, 
comparing actual demand against DC-on-hand, store-on-hand and in-transit 
inventory. 

 



 

Reverse and Aftermarket Logistics 

Reverse logistics is our post-sales support process in which we move goods from 
their typical final destination for proper or to capture value. Kangaroo Logistics Pvt 
Ltd aftermarket logistics capabilities include it’s leading solutions, which can handle 
the most complicated service-parts requirements. Reverse logistics includes 
inventory processing (excess, seasonal and returned due to damage ), shelf-life 
management, restocking, inventory control and traffic, salvaging, Re-working, re-
packing, re-labeling, testing and recall. We also include recycling programs. 

International Air / Sea / Land Freight forwarding Management 
Kangaroo Logistics Pvt Ltd provides comprehensive and professional service for 
delivery of your cargo by air, sea or by land. As one of the leading air, sea and land 
freight forwarders, we can handle large volumes on a global basis or specific 
requirements on a single route at any time and to any destination. We can manage 
your shipments on an individual basis or as part of an integrated supply chain 
solution. Our Logistic services also include Warehousing, Inventory Control & 
Worldwide Distribution, Container Drayage, Trucking, Logistics Consulting, 
Insurance Coverage, Customs Brokerage and Worldwide. 

Kangaroo Logistics Pvt Ltd is recognised as a leading intermediary providing 
extensive global coverage for your transport and forwarding services. You have a 
single point of contact investigating the carriers, trade 
lanes and service levels that best meet your needs. We track availability, frequency, 
transit time and cost, allowing you to easily select the service level you need. Our 
team of highly specialised industry professionals works to achieve the best possible 
solutions for your needs. With our process oriented approach and strong customer 
focus, you can be assumed that we work extra hard in meeting your special needs. 

Our range of freight management services encompasses: 

Air Freight 
Sea Freight 
LCL Consolidation Services 
Destination Door Delivery 

 



 

Air Freight 
Shipping your cargo by air with Kangaroo Logistics Pvt Ltd will keep goods moving 
at optimal speed and efficiency along the supply chain. As one of the best airfreight 
forwarders, our Air Freight Services provides three solutions, Value, Speed and Low 
Cost. We have established a professional air cargo services team around the globe 
thru our agent networks, spreading around all main airports across the globe. We 
are capable of handling import & export shipment from/to the four corners of the 
world. In order to satisfy your demand of space allocation and competitive price, we 
have kept strong relationship with airlines, agent and partners major carriers that 
secure space on most of the flights, our worldwide portfolio of preferred carriers, 
chosen for their professionalism, reliability and capacity, is complemented by the 
best local carriers, help us maintain peak and off-speak transit consistency. 

We also offer express clearances, 24x7 dedicated vehicles for door-to door delivery. 
And we have the expertise and experience to meet your most demanding logistics 
challenges. Our consolidations are fixed schedule and time definite, using only 
premium carriers with multiple departures per week from all major airports in every 
region. 

Sea Freight 
Kangaroo Logistics Pvt Ltd provides time definite, innovative sea freight services for 
both Full Container Loads (FCL) and Less Than Container Loads (LCL) shipments 
worldwide. As one of leading sea freight forwarders, we can handle large volumes on 
a global basis or specific requirements on a single route at any time and to any 
destination. We can manage your shipments on an individual basis or as part of an 
integrated supply chain solution. For your benefit of safe and accurate movement we 
operate thru our nominated Container Freight Station (CFS) or carrier relationships 
ensure loading priority for all of your sea shipments. And when congestion becomes 
an issue, our local experts work with you to book capacity and finds the most 
effective alternate routing, minimising delays and ensuring that goods arrive when 
needed 

Kangaroo Logistics Pvt Ltd also has range of value-added freight management 
services such as managing carrier contracts on your behalf. 

Additional Sea Freight Services: 

• Quality CFS facilities at major ports. 

• Transportation expertise at origin and destination. 

• Customised consolidation. 

• Local, proactive vendor management. Vendor documentation. 

• Packing, labelling Palletization and bar-coding. 

 



 

FCL (Full Container Loads) 

terms of attractive rates, transit time, security and service worldwide from our close 
partnership with premier sea carriers. Our value service is designed for customers 
seeking the most effective “Full container load” (FCL) sea freight option, while still 
meeting important time schedules. Kangaroo Logistics Pvt Ltd will deliver your FCL 
shipment anywhere worldwide. 

LCL (Less than Container Loads) 

Our experience in handling and packing LCL is proven and Kangaroo Logistics Pvt 
Ltd offers superior services providing regular, reliable, fast and cost effective weekly 
sailings. We offer reliable port-to-port and door-to-door transit times consistently 
throughout the year. Our Less than Container Load (LCL) Service offers you 
shipments with fixed schedules under our control at origin /destination. It is most 
consistently reliable LCL shipping service available. 

Customs Clearance & Security 

A well-designed and well-managed customs clearance program reduces cycle times, 
improves shipment visibility and lowers cost. Local experts of our Customs service 
enable timely and reliable movement of your goods through the customs process. 
We offer clearance in a consistent, timely and cost effective manner by acting as a 
direct extension of your business to develop individual service programs that are 
uniquely tailored to your needs. You are assigned a single point of contact that is 
trained to handle all of your customs clearance needs by licensed professionals to 
the extent permitted by law. Where available we provide translation and classification 
for documents. Because we check cargo availability, arrange physical inspections, 
re-stuffing and delivery. We also arrange survey of damaged cargo and obtain 
damage/loss reports to protect your right to make claims through underwrites 

Sea / Air Operations 

On an average, we handle 2-3 containers on a weekly basis. These shipments are 
transported to the nearby ports and custom cleared for further movements, 

 



 

Kangaroo Logistics Pvt Ltd definition of 
“Logistics” 

Logistics in a nutshell is based on 4 basic flows. A successful combination of these 
flows, according to customer requirements and market conditions, backed by the 
ideal mode of transport, will generate the exact Logistics solution. 

• Product Flow 

• Document Flow 

• Information Flow 

• Finance Flow 

Strategy 
KLPL’s Strategy is to develop logistics solutions with a clear mission, which will 
create new value for our customer. It is important to stay connected with the 
changing trends. Hence, it is a matter of necessity to develop industry-focused 
expertise, by taking a holistic approach that benefits our customers. To establish a 
corporate identity is our foremost strategy while providing solutions to our customers 
at the right place at the right time, at the right price. 

Vision 
Kangaroo Logistics Pvt Ltd has a vision to successfully grow and diversify business 
to the benefit of our customers and employees, creating value and profitability. 

Mission  
To build long term relationships with our customers and clients & provide exceptional 
customer service by pursuing business through innovation and advanced 
technology. 

Core Values  
We believe in treating our customers with respect and faith, we grow through 
creativity invention and innovation. we integrate honesty, integrity and business 
ethics into all aspects of our business functioning. 

Goals  
Regional Expansion in the field of logistics management and develop a strong base 
of key customers. increase the assists and investment of the company to support the 
development of services. to build good reputation in the field of logistics and service 
management and to become a key player in the industry. 

 




